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The importance of enhancing critical thinking skill 
of pre-service teachers

The paper deals with the necessity of continuous work on the development of the
critical thinking skill in higher education. More precisely, it aims to explain the
context in which the need for teaching critical literacy to future teachers arises.
The contemporary both professional and private challenges have been increased
by the information and communication technology. Apart from being functionally
literate teachers and students should improve the refined ability to read, write,
research and communicate in a way that supports critical analysis, interpretation,
processing and storing both print and non-print texts.  In addition, the author dis-
cusses the possibilities of incorporating critical literacy in school curriculum,
applying either implementation or teacher initiative, opting for the combination
of the two (teacher competencies and governmental support). The initial teacher
education must empower students not only to teach critical literacy to their own
students, but also to keep developing their critical thinking skill. 

iNTroducTioN

Literacy has traditionally been described as the ability to read and write (Mer-
riam-Webster’s Learner’s Online Dictionary) and it has always served some social
purpose. Due to the ongoing social changes, the face of literacy has been changing
as well. “The demand for some new literacy has been announced by the process
of internetization” (Previšić 2002, p.59). Undoubtedly, to be literate in contem-
porary society means possessing a greater scope of skills compared to the past
centuries.  For instance, in the past it was enough to be able to sign one’s name
without knowing how to read or write. Later on, to be considered literate, one had
to know how to read and write in Latin, without the same ability in a secular lan-
guage. For a long time, literacy was a privilege of the clerics and wealthy citizens
(Munjiza 2009). The ability to read was not necessarily accompanied by the ability
to write. Gellner (1983) points out that a Swedish law of 17th century successfully
made almost all of the population skilful readers in a hundred years time, yet till
the 19th century many Swedes, especially women, could not write. It took four
centuries after the invention of the printing press to make the majority of Europe-
ans literate, because the reading materials did not become affordable before the
industrial revolution. A technological revolution that we are witnessing nowadays
also affects the traditional understanding of literacy. There is a need for the kind
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of literacy that would improve global communication, but also improve indivi-
duals by making them self-actualised and more active citizens. 

how should this new kind of literacy be achieved? In the search for an answer
to this question all eyes are on school, since school has a dominant role in the pro-
cess of educating citizens and is perceived as the primary and central place for
becoming literate. New literacy requires a “new” way of thinking. Notar and Pad-
gett (2010) express doubt that there is anything new about the newly proclaimed
need to „think outside the box“. The discussion provides solid arguments that the
expression just stands for what was known as critical thinking, creativity, inno-
vation. They end with the fact that if there is a box to think within, then accidental
learning would never existed. In addition, Warshauer (2000) concludes that re-
gardless of the technology-related skill, there is still the need for critical, active,
and interpretative reading, which has been an important part of print literacy as
well. This paper aims to find out whether the face of literacy has changed so dra-
matically that it calls for a re-definition of literacy. More precisely, if there are
some newly emerged literacies, how should our schools respond to that? 

posTmoderNisT legacy

A complex set of reactions to modern philosophy and its presuppositions is con-
densed under the name of postmodernism. Slattery (1997, p. 4) states that post-
modernist philosophies have articulated the following concepts: “the death of the
subject, the repudiation of depth models of reality, the rejection of grand narrati-
ves or universal explanations of history, the illusion of the transparency of lan-
guage, the impossibility of any final meaning (...), the failure of pure reason to
understand the world, (...) the end of a belief in progress as a natural and neutral
panacea.”

historically speaking, it appeared on a cultural scene after the First World
War, developed after the Second World War and reigned supreme throughout
1980s and 1990s. The postmodern movement in art, architecture, philosophy, and
literary theory in those decades emphasized eclecticism, deconstruction (a process
different from destruction) and multiple forms of representation. humanity began
to resist and struggle with the modern world view, developing a new cosmology
that recognizes the limitations of the modern totalitarian beliefs and embraces
postmodern relativity. “The core of postmodernism is the doubt that any method
or theory, discourse or genre, tradition or novelty, has a universal and general
claim as the ‘right’ or privileged form of authoritative knowledge” (Richardson
1994, p. 517).

Postmodernism is itself understood in multiple ways and must not be mistaken
for a theory that reflects an agreement on substantive doctrines. It is not surprising
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then that it represents a celebration of difference and multiplicity. The concepts
that used to be taken for granted are now becoming re-analysed and their unders-
tanding depends on the multiple explanations, approaches and personalised pers-
pectives. A similar process has affected our understanding of the term literacy.
Postmodernism has established various concepts of literacy, creating a new coin
– new literacy, also used in plural due to the multiple understandings of the term.
According to Lankshear and Knobel (2003), there are two streams of scientific
research that focus on the different approaches to new literacy. 

First, there is a field of the New Literacy Studies (Street 2003), which repre-
sents a new tradition in concerning the nature of literacy, trying to understand li-
teracy as a social practice. It does not dwell on the acquisition of skills, as the
dominant approaches, but recognises multiple literacies, varying according to time
and space, and emphasises that the issues of text, power and identity must also be
taken into account.  Researchers of the New Literacy criticise the assumption that
literacy is a neutral autonomous occurrence that undoubtedly has positive effects
on other social and cognitive practices. In other words, they argue that literacy
does not automatically make people better and smarter citizens, and that such app-
roach fails to recognize the cultural background of the illiteracy, presenting wes-
tern conceptions of literacy as something universal. The same author therefore
suggests the so-called ideological model of literacy, which offers a more culturally
sensitive view on this phenomenon. There is not one literacy but there are various
literacies, and teachers must always be aware which and whose literacy they are
promoting in the classroom.

Another approach to multiple literacies tries to detect the new features of li-
teracy which are mostly caused by the rapid technological progress, especially in
computer science. This has a certain impact on social behaviour patterns and con-
sequently calls for a more adequate face of literacy suited for the contemporary
society. The definition of literacy must be broadened with many other skills, along
with the updated perception of reading and writing. As a result, we talk about mul-
timedia literacy, computer literacy, information literacy or technology literacy
(Kress 2003). Selber (2004) claims that multiliteracies should be understood as
an umbrella term for functional literacy, critical literacy and rhetorical literacy.
Applied to computer literacy, functional literacy would mean that computers
represent a tool and students are able to use them effectively. Critical literacy sees
computers as cultural artefacts and students are informed questioners of techno-
logy. Rhetorically literate students are reflective producers of technology using
computers as a hypertext media. Computer literacy seems to dominate our edu-
cational concerns. Nonetheless, the trap of focusing more on the technological is-
sues instead of literacy issues must be avoided. 
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digimoderNism

It is believed that postmodern theoretical glasses for the perception of the world
are no longer suitable in the contemporary societies.  Numerous aspects of life in
western societies are highly influenced by the development of information and
communication technology. Therefore, Kirby (2009) believes that a new cultural
paradigm is on stage and he names it digimodernism (digital + modernism). Di-
gimodernism is a direct consequence of the impact of computerisation on all forms
of art, culture and textuality. It has revolutionised traditional arts, invented new
cultural relationships, and slowly engulfed the textual world we live in. 

Its effect on literacy is best observed on the Internet, where it represents a
significant change in the nature of the text itself, seen vividly in the platforms of
Web 2.0. here, the digimodernist text permits the reader or viewer to intervene
textually, physically to make text, to add visible content or tangibly shape narrative
development. Web 2.0 is defined by O’Reilly (2006) as a perceived second gene-
ration of Web-based services which are characterised by open communication,
decentralisation of authority, freedom to share and re-use, user’s ownership of
data and an effectiveness of communication that develops proportionally as more
people use them. In other words, it allows users to learn and contribute to Web
2.0, unlike Web 1.0, which offered information only. The most popular examples
of interactive online communication are Facebook, Twitter, MySpace, blogs, chat
rooms, forums, message boards, Wikipedia, etc.

because of the new technology, new literacy skills are being developed. Luns-
ford (2008) argues that we are experiencing a literacy revolution based on the fact
that we write far more than any generation before us. Never before had we app-
roached the Ancient Greek ideal of democracy so closely though conversational
and public writing. Namely, it is becoming increasingly important to assess one's
audience and adapt the tone and technique in order to get the message across as
intended. Indeed, for the new generation of college students, writing makes sense
only when it is about persuading, organising and debating. Online communication
teaches them to deploy the kind of concision that lacked the previous generations
and at the same time the Internet is full of lengthy comments on current social
and political affairs. According to Schultz von Thun (2001), precisely the willing-
ness to be informed and the ability to create information are the prerequisites for
democracy. 

On the other hand, Williams (2006) warns that participation in Web 2.0 can
be simply a celebration of self, a narcissistic infatuation. The dilemma is that there
is a lot of information that individuals in an informed democracy need to know,
without realising that they need to know it. If their online activity comes down to
looking for information they like and agree with, they will never pay attention to
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the opposing attitudes and contrary world view that could make them reconsider
their beliefs, and thus learn. Adding to that, the issue of power is very important.
The general assumption, that power is accompanied by a level of responsibility,
and unless the responsibility is felt and active, the possession of power becomes
untenable, is not applicable to Web 2.0. here responsibility can be abused without
the loss of power, and as a result, fiction can parade as fact. So, given that parti-
cipation in electronic democracy is freely available, and there is no system of
checks and balances on the power that is derived from participation, a question
arises as to the development of responsibility in the context of education. because
there is a vast amount of online information, students need to develop not only
skills how to find the necessary and valid pieces of information but also the skills
to deal with them. The latter illustrates a crucial role of critical literacy in con-
temporary education. 

criTical liTeracy iN The educaTioNal coNTeXT

The use of computers in technology classrooms does not imply more effective te-
aching of literacy. To illustrate this point, Kramarski and Feldman (2000) have
discovered that the Internet environment contributes to student motivation, but
not to reading comprehension and metacognitive awareness. This means that stu-
dents should not be taught just technical knowledge and skills how to use com-
puters, but also refined reading, writing, research and communicating ability that
includes critical analysis, interpretation, processing and storing both print and
non-print text. Chun (2009) adds that a multiliteracies pedagogy fosters students’
critical awareness of multimodal texts by using students’ own resources. The de-
velopment of literacy and critical literacy need not be independent of each other.
In fact, they are mutually constitutive in a classroom that emphasises the need to
read the world.

Critical media literacy (Kellner 1998) thus involves developing conceptions of
interpretation and criticism. Engaging in assessment and evaluation of media texts
is particularly challenging and entails careful discussion of specific moral, pedago-
gical, political, or aesthetic criteria of critique. Critical media literacy not only teaches
students to learn from media, to resist media manipulation, and to use media materials
in constructive ways, but it is concerned with developing skills that will help create
good citizens and that will make them more motivated and competent participants
in social life. In short, the critically literate students ask themselves the following
questions while reading either traditional or digimodernist texts: What is the (hidden)
message? What are the arguments for that? Why the chosen media/type of a docu-
ment? Who is the target audience? What techiques are being employed to convey
the message? What purpose does this serve?, etc.
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Williams (2009) stresses that teaching critical literacy should result in a more
strongly developed sense of moral responsibility. The development of personal
responsibility for baumann (1993) represents an extension of postmodern relati-
vity in ethics (listening to one’s own consciousness as opposed to Kant’s catego-
rical imperative). According to Rodesiler (2010), classroom practice should
empower students to ask questions, provide opportunities for exploring text mes-
sages and introduce meta-language necessary for discussion (e.g. non-verbal com-
munication, representation, selection). but how should critical literacy be taught?
Different educational systems provide different answers to this question. 

Croatian National Curriculum Framework (2010) represents the initial step
in a process of changing the understanding of literacy within school curricula.
Firm boundaries between school subjects are to be blurred by the introduction of
cross – curricular themes. The goals of two such themes, Learning to learn and
Use of information & communication technology, are highly corresponded with
the goals of critical literacy: “Students will differentiate between facts and opini-
ons; be able to ask substantial and problem-related questions, search for and va-
lidate the information from various sources (dictionaries, maps, encyclopaedia,
Internet, etc.); acquire skills to cooperate, discuss certain topics and issues, and
come to  solutions (...); be able to apply their knowledge and skills in different si-
tuations, take over the responsibility for their own learning and achievements
(NCF, Learning to learn, p. 25); and be able to present data in a clear, logical, con-
cise and precise way; use effectively information and communication technology;
develop awareness of the consequences of the use of technology; develop critical
attitude regarding the validity and reliability of the available information and the
legislative and ethical principles of interactive usage of technologies in an infor-
mation society (NCF, Use of information & communication technology, p. 26).
In order to reform our educational system, these goals should be implemented in
each school curriculum and achieved on a classroom level. 

Unfortunately, the countries that have a longer tradition of teaching cross-
curricular themes than Croatia report many difficulties in the process. For
example, harris (2008) states that in the UK such approach have not resulted in
increased level of literacy due to the observed conflicting government instructions
for implementation coupled with an ever-increasing emphasis on performance
measures that create a school culture which leaves teacher little time for the cross-
curricular collaboration necessary to make impact on student learning. Further-
more, the collaboration of teachers is impeded by the subject-related differences
and teachers’ different views on the priorities that need to be taught, which causes
divergent messages and approaches, making it difficult for students to make trans-
ference between subjects. 

Similarly, Finger and houguet (2009) detect many intrinsic and extrinsic chal-



TRAINING AND PRACTICE ● VOLUME 9. ISSUE 1-2/2011

103

lenges identified by teachers themselves during their attempts at the implementa-
tion of technology education. Intrinsic challenges refer to challenges that teachers
may face on a personal level, such as professional knowledge and understanding
of new literacy, a level of professional confidence, attitudes toward technology
education, flexibility to modify teaching approaches and participation in curricu-
lum construction instead of implementation. Extrinsic challenges for teachers are
environmental factors, such as insufficient resources and time, the need to find
suitable methods for student assessment and the lack of history and (theoretical
and practical) tradition. It is evident that the quality of teaching new literacies,
including critical literacy, directly depends on the immediate work of teachers,
i.e. their competences.

implicaTioNs For Teacher educaTioN 

Individuals in the contemporary world must become critically literate in order to
be active citizens who make their choices responsibly. This applies both to stu-
dents, and their teachers. Apart from implementation of critical literacy through
educational legislative (top -down strategies), much can be done during the initial
education of teachers. Studies of the implementation of technology in the schools
(e.g. Cradler 1999; Robertson 2002; Cradler, Freeman, Cradler, and McNabb
2002) reveal that without adequate teaching training and technology policy, the
results of introducing computers and new media into education remain highly am-
biguous. Technology itself does not necessarily improve teaching and learning
and without proper resources, pedagogy, and educational practices, technology
might be an obstacle to genuine learning. 

So far the national approaches to technology education have not proved
to be  sustainably successful (Lowther 2004). Perhaps the reason for this lies in
the fact that the existing school curricula for the Generation Y students have been
designed by older generations. Generation Y is defined as a generation of young
people who are born in the 1980’s and 1990’s, and present the first generation that
has been immersed in technology all their lives (Yerbury 2010). They are also re-
fered to as 'digital natives' (Bennet, Maton and Kervin 2008), as opposed to other
generations who are 'digital immigrants'. Preservice teachers that are about to
enter work market are digital natives, who are believed to naturally posses the
functional computer literacy. 

however, critical literacy does not develop spontaneously. This is why te-
acher training collages should be developing their students’ critical literacy so that
they could become role models for their future school students in that respect.
This process should start by making them aware of the importance of critical li-
teracy for their personal and professional development (Tan and Guo 2009), and
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they themselves must become critical thinkers sensitive to cultural differences in
literacy.  Additionally, instruction in teaching strategies for critical reading and
writing skills should follow (Steel, Meredith and Temple 1998). Consequently,
more adequate forms of representation and assessment must be made acceptable. 

Teaching critical literacy can be organised in several ways. Firstly, critical li-
teracy can be taught as a separate course, with the obvious shortcoming of being
disconnected from the contents of other courses. It can also be integrated in an
already existing course (e.g. ICT, literature, foreign languages, etc.) and linked to
the themes and issues of a particular course. Finally, critical literacy can be taught
as a cross-curricular theme, in several or all university courses, which possibly
represents the most exhaustive and systematic approach but also the most chal-
lenging one. Such approach requires constant collaboration of university teachers
who should share the pedagogic and subject-specific knowledge and professional
attitudes and values. Most importantly, teachers of critical literacy must be willing
to continuously learn together with their students since literacy has become an es-
sentially dynamic construct that one is always developing towards and never achi-
eving.

coNclusioN

Within the field of literacy research, there is an increasing recognition that the ad-
vent of information and communication technology necessitates a broader con-
ception of literacy. A new definition of literacy is required to encompass not just
the traditional literacy, such as the ability to read and write, but also multiple li-
teracies related to multimedia technology. The concept of multiliteracies is em-
bedded in postmodern philosophy of relativism, and coupled with digimodernist
world view can be divided into functional literacy, critical literacy and rhetorical
literacy. This paper focused on critical literacy in educational context. The con-
temporary educational system in Croatia has started to acknowledge an increasing
importance of critical literacy, as it is evident from the National Curriculum Fra-
mework. It implies certain changes in teacher education as well. The role of tea-
cher training colleges is two-sided. In addition to teaching prospective teachers
how to think critically, they should also teach them how to teach critical literacy
to their own students. 

REFERENCES
baumann, Z. (1993). Postmodern Ethics. Cambridge, MA: basil blackwell. 
bennett, S., Maton, K. and Kervin, L. (2008) The ‘digital natives’ debate: A critical

review of the evidence. British Journal of Educational Technology. Vol. 39,
No. 5, pp. 775 - 786 



TRAINING AND PRACTICE ● VOLUME 9. ISSUE 1-2/2011

105

Chun, C. (2009). Critical Literacies and Graphic Novels for English-Language
Learners. Journal of Adolescent & Adult Literacy, Vol. 53, No. 2, pp. 144 -
153

Cradler, J. (1999). Implementing Technology in Education: Recent Findings from
Research and Evaluation Studies. Available at: http://www.wested.org/tech-
policy/recapproach.html (18/12/2010)

Cradler, J., Freeman, M., Cradler, R. and McNabb, M. (2002) Research implica-
tions for preparing teachers to use technology. Learning & Leading with Tech-
nology. Vol. 30, No. 1

Finger, G. and houguet, b. (2009). Insights into the intrinsic and extrinsic chal-
lenges for implementing technology education: case studies of queensland
teachers. International Journal of Technology and Design Education, No. 19,
pp.  309–334

Gellner, E. (1983). Nations and nationalism. New York: Cornell University Press
harris, V. (2008). A cross – curricular approach to 'learning to learn' languages:

government policy and school practice. The Curriculum Journal, Vol. 19, No.
4, pp. 255-268

Kellner, D. (1998). New Media and New Literacies: Reconstructing Education
for the New Millenium. In: Lievrouw, L. and Livingstone, S. (eds.), Handbook
of new media: social shaping and consequences of ICTs. London: SAGE Pub-
lications Ltd., pp. 90-104

Kirby, A. (2009). Digimodernism: How New Technologies Dismantle the Post-
modern and Reconfigure Our Culture. New York: Continuum.

Kramarski, b. and Feldman, Y. (2000). Internet in the Classroom: Effects on Re-
ading Comprehension, Motivation and Metacognitive Awareness. Education
Media International. Vol. 35, No. 3, 149 - 155 

Kress, G. R. (2003). Literacy in the new media age. New York: Routledge
Lankshear, C. and Knobel, M. (2003). New Literacies: Changing Knowledge and

the Classroom Practice. buckingham: Open University Press.
Lowther, J. (2004). Kvaliteta hrvatskoga formalnog obrazovanog sustava. In: be-

jaković, P., Lowther, J. (eds.) Konkurentnost hrvatske radne snage. Zagreb:
Institut za javne financije. pp. 59-74

Lunsford, A. (2008). The Stanford Study of Writing. Available at: http://ssw.stan-
ford.edu/research/research.php (6/11/2010)

Merriam-Webster’s Learner’s Dictionary. Literacy. Avaible at: http://www.lear-
nersdictionary.com/search/literacy (6/11/2010)

Munjiza, E. (2009). Povijest hrvatskog školstva i pedagogije. Osijek: Filozofski
fakultet i Slavonski brod: hPKZ. 

Nacionalni okvirni kurikulum (2010). Ministarstvo znanosti, obrazovanja i športa.
Available at: http://public.mzos.hr/Default.aspx?sec=2685 (20/11/2010)



KÉPZÉS ÉS GYAKORLAT ● 9. ÉVFOLYAM 2011/1–2. SZÁM

106

Notar, C. and Padgett, S. (2010). Is thinking outside the box 21st century code
for imagination, innovation, creativity, critical thinking, intuition? College
Student Journal, Vol. 44, No. 2, pp. 294 - 303

O’Reilly, T. (2006). Web 2.0 Compact Definition. Available at: http://www.radar.
oreilly.com/archives/2006/12/web_20_compact.html (18/12/2010)

Previšić, V. (2002). Postmoderne paradigme u pedagogijskoj teoriji i praksi. In:
Rosić, V.  (ed.) Odnos pedagogijske teorije i pedagoške prakse.  Rijeka: Filo-
zofski fakultet u Rijeci,  pp. 56-63

Richardson, L. (1994). Writing: A method of inquiry. In: Denzin, N. and Lincoln,
Y. (eds.) Handbook of Qualitative Research. Thousand Oaks, CA: SAGE Pub-
lications, Ltd.

Robertson, J. (2002). The ambiguous embrace: twenty years of IT (ICT) in UK
primary schools. British Journal of Educational Technology. Vol. 3,3 No. 4,
pp. 403–409

Rodesiler, L. (2010). Empowering Students Through Critical Media Literacy: This
Means War. The Clearing House, No. 83, pp. 164 – 167

Schultz von Thun, F. (2001). Kako međusobno komuniciramo. Zagreb: Erudita.
Selber, S. (2004). Multiliteracies for a digital age. Carbondale: Southern Illinois

University Press.
Slattery, P. (1997). Postmodern Curriculum Research and Alternative Forms of

Data Presentation. Available at:  http://www.quasar.ualberta.ca/cpin/cpinfol-
der/papers/slattery.htm (18/11/2010)

Steel, J. L., Meredith, K. S. and Temple, C. (1998) Čitanje i pisanje za kritičko
mišljenje. Zagreb: Forum za slobodu odgoja. 

Street, b. (2003). What's „New“ in New Literacy Studies? Critical approaches to
literacy in theory and practice. Current Issues in Comparative Education. Vol.
5, No. 2, pp. 77– 91 

Tan, L. and Guo, L. (2009). From Print to Critical Multimedia Literacy: One Te-
acher’s Foray Into New Literacies Practices, Journal of Adolescent & Adult
Literacy. Vol. 53, No. 4, pp. 315–324

Warschauer, M. (2000). The Changing Global Economy and the Future of English
Teaching.   Available at: http://www.gse.uci.edu/person/warschauer_m/glo-
bal.html (20/11/2010)

Williams, P. J. (2009). Technological literacy: a multiliteracies approach for de-
mocracy. International Journal of Technology and Design Education. Vol. 19,
No. 3, pp. 237 -254 

Williams, b. (2006). Enough About You. Available at: http://www.time.com/
time/magazine/article/0,9171,1570707,00.html (20/11/2010)

Yerbury, h. (2010). Who to be? Generations X and Y in civil society online. Youth
Studies Australia. Vol. 29, No. 2, pp. 25 – 32 


